
Extended
Childcare

30 hour

Cheshire West & 
Chester Council

By now you will have heard about the
national initiative to increase the number of
free hours of childcare available to some
working families across the country from 15

hours a week to 30.

Provider Information

Next Steps
Some of you will already be working across
settings to provide families with wraparound
childcare and we will be keen to see how this
works, your successes and challenges.
We hope to have a Project Officer in post
shortly who will be communicating regularly
with all childcare providers keeping you up to
date with changes and progress over the next
year. We will also be contacting you seeking
expressions of interest in delivering the 30
hours to ensure we have sufficient places to
offer families across the borough. 

Whilst funding for places will not be available
until the scheme is implemented nationally,
the Council will be working with childcare
providers across the borough and the
Department for Education over the coming
year to develop the offer so that parents are
able to access local childcare that fits with
their personal working patterns and hours.
The extended entitlement will mean that
parents can be more flexible with their working
hours, could increase their hours and may be
able to have childcare over holiday periods.
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Current eligibility criteria for the
'extended entitlement' is that;
•   both parents are working (or the sole 
     parent is working in a lone parent family)
•   each parent earns, on average, a weekly 
     minimum equivalent to 16 hours at
     national
•   minimum wage (NMW) or national living 
     wage (NLW);
•    and less than £100,000 per year.

Foster carers are not eligible for the extended
entitlement for the children that they foster.

Working includes employed persons,
self-employed persons and parents on zero
hours contracts who meet the criteria.

It is proposed that the 'extended entitlement'
will continue to be offered to families where
the criteria would be met but where one
parent was not in work as a result of parental
leave, maternity/paternity leave, adoption
leave, statutory sick pay or that one parent
was in receipt of specific benefits for caring
responsibilities or a disability.

Innovator Authority
Cheshire West and Chester Council has been
successful in becoming one of a number of
Innovator authorities across the country
tasked with testing aspects of the scheme to
ensure that the rollout runs smoothly for
families. Although we are unable to fund
childcare places before September 2017
funding from the Government will allow us to
work over the next 12 months to develop two
or three  Community Childcare and Early
Learning Hubs with the flexibility within the
community to   respond to the varying
childcare needs of local families.

Community Childcare and Early
Learning Hubs
Why do we need Hubs? Childcare Hubs are a
solution to the limited availability of high
quality, flexible childcare and early education
that many parents face. Originally piloted by
4Children on behalf of DfE around the country,
they bring together different kinds of childcare
for children 0 –11 in one local area to offer a
blended range of options for parents that are
flexible, co-ordinated and high quality in a
‘community childcare and early learning
hub’.

Childcare Hubs offer:
•   One stop hub of information for parents to 
     find out about and access childcare in their 
     local community.

•    A choice of coordinated childcare each week
     including nursery, childminders and out of 
     school care blended to suit the families’ 
     needs that week. 

•    A guarantee of high quality with all 
     providers benefiting from training and 
     support

Benefits of the Hub Approach:
     - Communities able to offer “Blended” 
        childcare for families

     - Flexible, consistent, quality childcare for 
        parents

     - Accessible, localised childcare information 

     - Improved training and CPD for childcare 
        sector

     - Improved business/relationships

     - Effective transition between settings for 
        children

     - Improved local employment opportunities 


